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1/4/24

1/18/24

1/18/24

2/1/24

2/1/24

2/1/24

2/1/24

2/15/24

2/29/24

Award

Award

Bids Extended for 2024
Roadside Spray

Chip Seal
Crush/Shape/Stab
Cold Patch

Awarded to

Concrete/Cement
Awarded to Rock

Liquid Calcium Chloride

Cr. Gravel

Hired Equipment

Fed Aid HMA Design 2025
Fairgrove Rd
Fairgrove VL to M-24

Fed Aid HMA Design 2025
Millington Rd
Vassar to Fulmer

Prof Eng/Bridge Design
Wells Rd
Chambers East 1 Mile

Fabricating and Supplying Box Culvert

Consultant
Northern Conc Pipe

HMA Machine Patches
Contractor

Esch Landscaping
Pavement Recycling Inc

Contractor
Esch Landscaping
Pavement Recycling Inc

Overband Crack Fill

Guardrail
Bridge Safety Inspections
Pavement Marking

Bidder
Unique Paving Materials
Ace Saginaw Paving Co

Bidder
Rock Products

Bidder
Michigan Chloride Sales, LLC
Liquid Calcium Chloride Sales

See Attached
Awarded in Best Interest of TCRC

Various equip/bidders

Consultant
Spicer Group
Guordie Fraser Inc

Consultant
Spicer Group
Guordie Fraser Inc

Consultant
Spicer Group
Guardie Fraser Inc

Material
UPM Cold Mix
QPR

Concrete-3500
$179.00/cyd

Continuous
No Bid
$.677 p/gal

Cost for Design Pkg
$21,900.00
$17,300.00

Cost for Design Pkg
$18,900.00
$15,400.00

Cost for Design Pkg
$85,700.00
$50,540.00

Awarded to Northern Con

2024
BID RESULTS

Price Per Ton
$132.10
$127.10

Concrete-4500
$183.00/cyd

Intermittent
No Bid
$.687 p/gal

Awarded in Best Interest of TCRC As Needed

Cement
N/A by pound $21.00/bag

Road Commission Pickup
No Bid
$.59 p/gal

($26,700 Survey, $59,000 Design)

Elowable Fill
$159.00/cyd

Awarded to Lig Calc (Bay Dust)

Cost for Culv Comp.Drawi/fab Del LSUM Cost for 42" Conc Pipe _ x65ft= Cost for 72" Dr Str___Eachx 1= Cost for 42" Conc End Sec Each x 1= Total Cost
$225,260.00 $120.50 $7,832.50 $4,340.00 $4,340.00 $1,493.00 $1,493.00  $238,925.50

Awarded in Best Interest

Local Road Price Per Ton 10to 50 50 & over Skip Patching > 50  Skip Patching HMA<50 Butt Joint

0to5 6to 10

$430.00  $345.00 $255.00 $200.00 $170.00 $190.00 $120.00 $60.00
No Bid No Bid $700.00 $235.00 No Bid $235.00 No Bid No Bid

Primary Road Price Per Ton 10to 50 50 & over Skip Patching > 50  Skip Patching HMA<50

Oto5 6to0 10
$525.00  $365.00
No Bid  No Bid

Awarded to Fahrner

$295.00 $225.00
$700.00 $235.00

Contractor Overband Crack Fill, Lane Contractor Supplied Lane Mile Unit Price
Fahrner Asphalt P+T Durafill 1190 Deery 103 Dura Fill 1190 $1,638.00
Wolverine Sealcoating Dura Fill 1190 $2,250.00

Contractor Overband Crack Fill, Lane Lane Mile Unit Price
Fahrner Asphalt Crafco 3415T (TCRC Supplied) $1,130.00
Wolverine Sealcoating Crafco 3415T (TCRC Supplied) $1,600.00
Contractor HMA Crack Treatment, Lane Contractor Supplied Lane Mile Unit Price
Fahrner Asphalt P+T Durafill 1190 Deery 103 Dura Fill 1100 and P+T 101 ELT $1,638.00
Wolverine Sealcoating P and T Products 3725 $2,200.00
Contractor HMA Crack Treatment, Lane TCRC Supplied Lane Mile Unit Price
Fahrner Asphalt Crafco 3415T (TCRC Supplied) $1,130.00
Wolverine Sealcoating Crafco 3415T (TCRC Supplied) $1,650.00

$195.00
No Bid

$205.00
$235.00

$4,950.00
No Bid

HMA Surf Rmvl Cold Milling 1/2 day cold Milling Whole Day

$8,000.00
No Bid

04/12/2024



2/29/24

2/29/24

2/29/24

2129124

2024
BID RESULTS

Professional Engineering and Bridge Design Services

Consultant

Spicer Group, Inc

GT Bridge, PLLC

CMPipe
Awarded to St Regis

Street Signs

Three (3) 3/4 Ton Pickups
Vendor

Mike Young-Frankenmuth
Bell-Wasik-Caro

Moore Motor Sales-Caro
Bob Maxey Ford-Detroit
Cook Chevrolet-Vassar

Cost for Innovative Design Pkg Proposed Innovative Process Est Cons Cost Costor 2027 MDOT Local Bridge Funding A

Superstructure replcmt of
exist bridge w/ galvanized
press brake tub girders and
$49,000.00 concr deck $882,000.00 $762,000.00
Prefab superstructure units
to reduce const sched &

$57,596.00 Bridge closure duration $1,125,000.00 $1,159,000.00
Cadillac Culvert Jensen Bridge & Supply St. Reqis Culvert
$37,885.55 $38,031.27 $37,726.30

Awarded to Newman

Awarded to Moore Motors

Price per truck Del Charge Truck/Deliv Total Price Est Del Date
$51,409.00 N/A $51,409.00 8-10 weeks
$49,226.00 N/A $49,226.00 4-8 weeks(after acccepted by GM)
$46,675.76 N/A $46,675.76 Ordered Units/May Built Date
$47,460.00 N/A $47,460.00 90-120 Days ARO

$50,130.00 N/A $50,130.00 Alloc Avail Timeframe

04/12/2024



